

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

## GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

**REGION:** REGION V - BICOL REGION  
**PROVINCE:** CAMARINES SUR  
**CITY/MUN:** CITY OF NAGA

**CALENDAR YEAR:** 2023  
**QUARTER:** 4

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Approved Budget for Contract	Location	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
1	2023-045	SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF FOOD COMMODITIES FOR USE DURING THE 13TH CYCLE SUPPLEMENTARY FEEDING PROGRAM OF EDUCARE AND SEED MONTESSORI (LOT 1)	<b>3,659,230.00</b>	EDUCARE, SEED MONTESSORI	THESSON'S MARKETING	Ms. KIMXUAN SANDICO NGUYEN Owner/Proprietor #8 Dacudao Building, Panganiban Drive, Bgy. Lerma, Naga City	<b>3,381,151.00</b>	October 23, 2023	Various dates as indicated in the Invitation to Bid
		SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF FOOD COMMODITIES FOR USE DURING THE 13TH CYCLE SUPPLEMENTARY FEEDING PROGRAM OF EDUCARE AND SEED MONTESSORI (LOT 2)	<b>2,071,314.00</b>	EDUCARE, SEED MONTESSORI	CAMARINES SUR MULTI-PURPOSE COOPERATIVE	Ms. ELMA S. CUEVAS Authorized Representative Zone 4, Cadlan Pili, Camarines Sur	<b>2,070,327.66</b>	October 23, 2023	Various dates as indicated in the Invitation to Bid
2	2023-046	SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF FOOD COMMODITIES FOR USE DURING THE 13TH CYCLE SUPPLEMENTARY FEEDING PROGRAM OF EDUCARE AND SEED MONTESSORI (LOT 1)	<b>620,906.60</b>	EDUCARE, SEED MONTESSORI	THESSON'S MARKETING	Ms. KIMXUAN SANDICO NGUYEN Owner/Proprietor #8 Dacudao Building, Panganiban Drive, Bgy. Lerma, Naga City	<b>620,667.60</b>	October 23, 2023	Various dates as indicated in the Invitation to Bid
		SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF FOOD COMMODITIES FOR USE DURING THE 13TH CYCLE SUPPLEMENTARY FEEDING PROGRAM OF EDUCARE AND SEED MONTESSORI (LOT 2)	<b>657,480.00</b>	EDUCARE, SEED MONTESSORI	THESSON'S MARKETING	Ms. KIMXUAN SANDICO NGUYEN Owner/Proprietor #8 Dacudao Building, Panganiban Drive, Bgy. Lerma, Naga City	<b>657,240.00</b>	October 23, 2023	Various dates as indicated in the Invitation to Bid

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

## GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

**REGION:** REGION V - BICOL REGION  
**PROVINCE:** CAMARINES SUR  
**CITY/MUN:** CITY OF NAGA

**CALENDAR YEAR:** 2023  
**QUARTER:** 4

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Approved Budget for Contract	Location	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
3	2023-042	SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF RICE (A REPUBLICATION AFTER A FAILED BIDDING) FOR DISTRIBUTION TO NEEDY FAMILIES AND SENIOR CITIZENS OF NAGA (PASKOHAN SA NAGA 2023) (LOT 1)	4,600,000.00	CSWD Office	NO BID			October 2, 2023	On or before Week 4 October 2023
		SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF RICE (A REPUBLICATION AFTER A FAILED BIDDING) FOR DISTRIBUTION TO NEEDY FAMILIES AND SENIOR CITIZENS OF NAGA (PASKOHAN SA NAGA 2023) (LOT 2)	12,190,000.00	CSWD Office	THESSON'S MARKETING	Ms. TESSIE A. SANDICO-NGUYEN Owner/Proprietor #8 Dacudao Building, Panganiban Drive, Bgy. Lerma, Naga City	10,959,500.00	October 2, 2023	On or before Week 4 October 2023
4	2023-047	SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF RICE FOR DISTRIBUTION TO SANGGAWADAN BENEFICIARIES	1,750,000.00	CSWD Office	THESSON'S MARKETING	Ms. KIMXUAN SANDICO NGUYEN Owner/Proprietor #8 Dacudao Building, Panganiban Drive, Bgy. Lerma, Naga City	1,750,000.00	November 6, 2023	On or before Week 3 November 2023
5	2023-048	SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF ADAPTED RESCUE VEHICLE FOR PWDS FOR USE IN THE DEPLOYMENT OF EMERGENCY RESPONSE TEAM DURING CALAMITIES AND DISASTERS	1,500,000.00	Person with Disability Affairs Office	DOMAIN CA GENERAL MERCHANDISE	Ms. MARILYN A. AMADOR Owner/Proprietor San Lorenzo Street, Guilid Ligao City	1,200,000.00	November 20, 2023	30

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Civil Works

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.


## GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

**REGION:** REGION V - BICOL REGION  
**PROVINCE:** CAMARINES SUR  
**CITY/MUN:** CITY OF NAGA

**CALENDAR YEAR:** 2023  
**QUARTER:** 4

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Approved Budget for Contract	Location	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
-----	---------------	-----------------	------------------------------	----------	----------------	------------------	------------	--------------	-------------------

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

  
\_\_\_\_\_  
**CECILLE S. DAPLIN**  
BAC Secretariat Head

  
\_\_\_\_\_  
**ENGR. ALEXANDER N. CANING**  
BAC Chairperson