
REFERENCE CRN 2022-033 ABC: P 2,642,901.00 PROCURING UNIT: NAGA CITY HOSPITAL
TIME AND DATE: 3pm, 10/24/2022 LOCATION: CITY PROCUREMENT OFFICE

Item No. Qty. Unit Items
 Approved Budget for 
the Contract (ABC) 

 Escada Medical 
Supply 

 Physiotec Drug Co.  Biomerjs Trading 

   MEDICINES  
1 100 pcs Abdominal Binder 20,000.00         19,000.00    13,800.00        14,850.00      
2 30 pcs Armsling Small 6,000.00            1,950.00      1,620.00          2,175.00        
3 30 pcs Armsling Medium 6,000.00            1,950.00      1,620.00          2,175.00        
4 30 pcs Armsling Large 6,000.00            1,950.00      1,620.00          2,175.00        
5 50 pcs Asepto Syringe 2,500.00            NO BID 1,850.00          2,220.00        
6 36 pcs Chromic 3/0 Cutting 12,600.00         1,980.00      1,008.00          4,450.32        
7 60 pcs Chromic 2/0 Double Arm 21,000.00         3,300.00      1,896.00          8,887.20        
8 50 pcs Chromic 1/0 Round 17,500.00         NO BID 1,580.00          6,853.00        
9 300 bxs Cord Clamp 180,000.00       166,500.00 1,080.00          90,720.00      

10 100 roll Cotton 400g 20,000.00         20,000.00    12,900.00        15,525.00      
11 300 pcs Cotton Applicator 900.00               795.00         630.00             810.00           
12 500 bxs Clean Gloves Powder free, latex-type 400,000.00       160,000.00 132,500.00      NO BID
13 50 pcs Elastic Bandage 2X5 3,750.00            1,500.00      1,400.00          840.00           
14 100 pcs Elastic Bandage 4X5 7,500.00            4,000.00      3,200.00          2,565.00        
15 50 pcs Elastic Bandage 6X5 6,250.00            3,250.00      1,950.00          2,030.00        
16 50 pcs Epidural Set Perifri G.18 130,000.00       90,000.00    95,000.00        90,090.00      
17 50 pcs ECG Paper 63mmX30m 3,200.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID
18 5 Liter Ethyl Alcohol+Propyl Alcohol (SOFTAMAN) 12,500.00         NO BID 12,500.00        12,000.00      
19 50 bxs Fetal Monitor Paper 152mmX90mmX150sheet, Sunray (compatible with Sunray equipment)40,000.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID
20 50 pcs Foley Catheter F16 877.50               NO BID NO BID NO BID
21 20 pcs Foley Cathter F18 600.00               NO BID 560.00             NO BID
22 2 bxs Free Needle Round, 01/2 9x24 1,600.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID
23 2 bxs Free Needle Cutting 1,600.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID
24 100 roll Absorbent Gauze Roll (24x28) 89,000.00         NO BID 89,000.00        NO BID
25 100 roll Gauze Bandage 28X4 mesh 36X100g 2ply 100,000.00       NO BID 89,500.00        88,965.00      
26 200 pcs Heparin Cap 120,000.00       NO BID 10,200.00        6,000.00        
27 100 Liter Hydrogen Peroxide 15,000.00         11,000.00    11,000.00        9,450.00        
28 20 gal Instrument Disinfectant Aldehide Free (STABIMED) 160,000.00       NO BID NO BID 127,400.00    
29 500 pcs IV Cannula G.26 15,000.00         9,000.00      6,000.00          10,800.00      
30 1000 pcs IV Cannula G.24 30,000.00         18,000.00    10,740.00        18,900.00      
31 1000 pcs IV Cannula G.22 30,000.00         18,000.00    10,740.00        16,200.00      
32 1000 pcs IV Cannula G.20 30,000.00         18,000.00    10,740.00        16,200.00      
33 1000 pcs IV Cannula G.18 30,000.00         18,000.00    10,740.00        16,200.00      
34 200 tube Lubricating Jelly 70,000.00         NO BID 33,000.00        21,330.00      
35 1000 pcs Macroset 50,000.00         32,000.00    12,880.00        23,436.00      
36 50 boxes Hypoallergenic paper tape 27,000.00         NO BID 17,500.00        NO BID
37 200 pcs Nasal Oxygen Cannula (adult) 3,448.00            NO BID 3,436.00          3,380.00        
38 200 PCS Nasal Oxygen Cannula (pedia) 3,448.00            NO BID 3,436.00          NO BID
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39 150 pcs Nebulizer Kit Adult 15,000.00         9,750.00      6,990.00          7,425.00        
40 150 pcs Nebulizer Kit Pedia 15,000.00         9,750.00      6,990.00          7,425.00        
41 10 bxs Needle G23X1 2,000.00            NO BID NO BID 1,612.00        
42 50 bxs Needle G25X5/8 10,000.00         NO BID NO BID 8,060.00        
43 200 pcs Oxygen Facemask Adult 20,000.00         13,000.00    15,742.00        8,840.00        
44 200 pcs Oxygen Facemask Pedia 20,000.00         13,000.00    15,742.00        7,800.00        
45 25 pcs Oxygen Facemask Neonate 2,500.00            2,500.00      2,375.00          1,235.00        
46 50 pcs Polydioxane Absordable Suture 1/0 Round 60,000.00         30,000.00    NO BID NO BID
47 60 pcs Polygactin 3/0 Cutting 18,000.00         18,000.00    13,500.00        NO BID
48 20 pcs Plaster of Paris 6X5y 12/box 6,000.00            4,000.00      2,800.00          3,410.00        
49 500 pcs Soluset 115,000.00       79,000.00    54,500.00        86,800.00      
50 100 pcs Spinocan 0.53X88mm/25gX3 1/2 20,000.00         10,500.00    15,500.00        10,248.00      
51 50 gal Sterilizing + Disinfectant Solution 10,000.00         NO BID 9,950.00          NO BID
52 200 pcs Sterile Water for Injection 100ml/bottle 70,000.00         20,000.00    13,600.00        NO BID
53 50 pcs Suction Set Yangkuer Handle W/Control 210cm 10,000.00         9,950.00      9,900.00          8,400.00        
54 20 pcs Suction Tip F8 250.00               230.00         240.00             NO BID
55 50 pcs Straight Catheter F.16 877.50               NO BID 875.00             697.50           
56 100 bxs Sterile Gloves Size 6.5 90,000.00         NO BID 88,700.00        NO BID
57 100 bxs Sterile Gloves Size 7.0 90,000.00         NO BID 88,700.00        85,800.00      
58 100 bxs Sterile Gloves Size 7.5 90,000.00         NO BID 88,700.00        NO BID
59 100 bxs Sterile Gloves Size 8.0 90,000.00         NO BID 90,000.00        NO BID
60 50 pcs Transparent Adhesive Waterproof Film 15x10cmx10cmx0.5cm 20,000.00         NO BID 19,300.00        NO BID
61 50 pcs Opsite 20x10cmx10cmx0.5cm (transparent tape) 20,000.00         NO BID 18,900.00        12,359.25      
62 150 pcs Urine Bag 15,000.00         5,250.00      3,750.00          4,657.50        
63 200 pcs Wadding Sheet 5inches X4y/roll 30,000.00         23,000.00    13,600.00        9,600.00        
64 100 pcs Zinc Oxide Adhesive Plaster 130,000.00       NO BID 128,500.00      120,960.00    

Grand Total 2,642,901.00    848,105.00 1,314,480.00   1,001,955.77 -               -               


