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   MEDICINES  
1 1,000 sachets Acetylcysteine 200mg 22,000.00         NO BID NO BID 22,000.00    10,500.00      17,000.00      
2 1,000 sachets Acetylcysteine 600mg 25,000.00         18,750.00    NO BID NO BID NO BID 13,200.00      20,000.00      
3 500 tablets Aciclover 300mg 1,480.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 144 susp. Aluminum/Magnesium 200mg/100mg/5ml 3,312.00            NO BID 3,312.00      3,312.00      NO BID 2,908.80        2,880.00        
5 1,000 tablets Aluminum/Magnesium 200mg/100mg 4,000.00            3,800.00      750.00         2,100.00      NO BID 1,450.00        2,500.00        
6 10 amp Amiodarone 150mg/ampule 2,453.50            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 3,000 tablets Amlodipine 5mg tab 3,000.00            2,850.00      930.00         1,650.00      NO BID 1,350.00        2,850.00        
8 1,000 bottles Amlodipine+Losartan 5mg+50mg 6,500.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 288 bottles Amoxicillin 125mg/5ml sus. 5,184.00            NO BID NO BID 5,184.00      NO BID 5,178.24        NO BID

10 288 bottles Amoxicillin 100mg/ml drops 4,809.60            NO BID NO BID 4,775.04      NO BID 4,682.88        NO BID
11 1,000 capsules Amoxicillin 500mg 4,000.00            NO BID 2,340.00      2,290.00      NO BID 1,900.00        3,500.00        
12 1,000 capsules Amoxicillin 250mg 2,000.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1,450.00        NO BID
13 144 bottles Amoxicillin 125mg/5ml sus. 2,793.60            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2,628.00        NO BID
14 288 bottles Ascorbic Acid 100mg/5ml syr. 7,200.00            NO BID NO BID 6,624.00      NO BID 4,573.44        6,912.00        
15 288 bottles Ascorbic Acid 100mg/ml oral drops 15ml 4,602.24            NO BID 5,716.80      4,596.48      NO BID 4,392.00        NO BID
16 3,000 tablets Ascorbic Acid 500mg 2,700.00            NO BID 1,830.00      2,550.00      NO BID 1,980.00        2,700.00        
17 1,000 tablets Aspirin 80mg tab 2,000.00            NO BID 1,000.00      1,900.00      NO BID 750.00           1,500.00        
18 300 amp Anti-Tetanus Serum 1,500 iu amp. 19,164.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
19 3,000 tablets Atorvastatin 40mg 13,500.00         NO BID 8,940.00      13,500.00    NO BID 11,400.00      10,500.00      
20 50 amp Atropine Sulfate 1mg/ml 980.00               NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
21 200 amp Bacillus Clausii 5ml 9,000.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 4,600.00        6,400.00        
22 1,000 tablets Betahistine 16mg 9,000.00            8,100.00      1,200.00      6,400.00      NO BID 3,900.00        8,500.00        
23 1,000 tablets Butamirate Citrate 500mg tab 14,000.00         NO BID NO BID 9,850.00      NO BID 7,200.00        12,000.00      
24 144 bottles Butamirate Citrate syr 60ml. 15,840.00         NO BID 15,696.00    NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
25 1,000 tablets Calcium Carbonate 500mg 600.00               NO BID NO BID 580.00         NO BID 570.00           NO BID
26 288 bottles Carbocisteine 100mg/5ml drops 32,256.00         16,128.00    NO BID 6,912.00      NO BID 6,336.00        NO BID
27 288 bottles Carbocisteine 100mg/5ml syr. 60ml 11,232.00         NO BID 7,200.00      10,368.00    NO BID 5,472.00        NO BID
28 1,000 capsules Celecoxib 200mg 4,500.00            4,190.00      1,920.00      4,400.00      NO BID 2,720.00        3,000.00        
29 5,000 tablets Cetirizine 10mg 15,000.00         9,000.00      2,250.00      3,450.00      NO BID 2,600.00        10,000.00      
30 288 bottles Cetirizine 5mg/5ml 8,352.00            NO BID 8,064.00      7,488.00      NO BID 6,912.00        7,200.00        
31 288 bottles Cetirizine 2.5ml drops 8,352.00            NO BID 7,488.00      NO BID 7,488.00        8,064.00        
32 288 bottles Cefalexin 125mg/5ml sus. 8,640.00            NO BID 6,912.00      8,064.00      NO BID 6,819.84        NO BID
33 288 bottles Cefalexin 125mg/5ml sus. 5,601.60            NO BID NO BID 5,466.24      NO BID 6,819.84        NO BID
34 288 bottles Cefixime 100mg/5ml sus 31,680.00         NO BID NO BID 29,952.00    NO BID NO BID NO BID
35 500  capsules Cefixime 200mg cap. 3,645.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
36 288  bottles Cefixime 20mg/ml drops 38,592.00         NO BID NO BID 35,337.60    NO BID NO BID NO BID
37 288  bottles Cefuroxime 125mg/5ml sus. 27,360.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 26,784.00      NO BID
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38 100 vials Ceftriaxone 1g for injection 15,000.00         NO BID 3,300.00      14,820.00    NO BID 2,480.00        10,000.00      
39 300  amp Cefuroxime 750mg/ml vial 5,967.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5,382.00        NO BID
40 1,000 tablets Ciprofloxacin 500mg 1,670.00            NO BID NO BID 1,670.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID
41 500  tablets Citicoline 500mg 12,500.00         12,375.00    11,500.00    9,740.00      NO BID 12,000.00      NO BID
42 10 amp Citicoline 250mg/ml amp. 2,550.00            NO BID 2,000.00      NO BID NO BID 657.00           2,100.00        
43 288  bottles Clarithromycin 125mg/ml sus. 25,920.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
44 1,000 tablets Clarithromycin 500mg tab 15,000.00         NO BID NO BID 14,250.00    NO BID 13,000.00      NO BID
45 2,000  capsules Clindamycin 300mg cap 14,000.00         NO BID 9,420.00      9,780.00      NO BID 10,160.00      NO BID
46 1,000 tablets Clonidine 75mg 4,700.00            NO BID NO BID 4,610.00      NO BID 4,680.00        NO BID
47 2,000 capsules Cloxacillin 500mg 5,400.00            NO BID NO BID 4,760.00      NO BID 5,200.00        NO BID
48 288  bottles Cloxacillin 125mg/5ml for susp 60ml 8,640.00            8,553.60      NO BID 7,770.24      NO BID 5,587.20        NO BID
49 1,000 tablets Co-amoxiclav 625mg 15,000.00         13,500.00    13,000.00    NO BID NO BID 9,860.00        14,000.00      
50 228 bottles Co-amoxiclav 228/ml susp. 14,820.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
51 500 tablets Colchicine 500mcg 7,000.00            4,550.00      700.00         NO BID NO BID 990.00           4,500.00        
52 144 bottles Cotrimoxazole 220mg/40mg/5ml susp. 2,875.68            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
53 50 vials D50W 50mg/vial 3,750.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2,800.00        3,500.00        
54 500 tablets Dextromethorphan 10mg tab 1,500.00            NO BID NO BID 995.00         NO BID 450.00           NO BID
55 288 bottles Dextromethorphan 10mg syr 5,760.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5,241.60        NO BID
56 288 bottles Diphenhydramine 12.5mg/5ml (syr.) 4,564.80            NO BID NO BID 4,564.80      NO BID 4,550.40        NO BID
57 1,000 capsules Diphenhydramine 50mg 690.00               NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 670.00           NO BID
58 300 amp Diphenhydramine 50mg/ml (amp) 9,900.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 7,800.00        9,000.00        
59 1,000  tablets Diclofenac 50mg (tab) 3,000.00            2,700.00      2,500.00      940.00         NO BID 850.00           2,000.00        
60 288 syr Dicycloverine 10mg/5ml 5,040.00            NO BID NO BID 5,025.60      NO BID 4,893.12        NO BID
61 500 tablets Digoxin 250mg 5,000.00            4,750.00      NO BID 4,960.00      NO BID 2,495.00        4,000.00        
62 10 amp Digoxin 0.5mg/ampule 3,000.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2,600.00        NO BID
63 10 vials Dobutamine 250mg/20ml vial 2,350.00            NO BID 2,200.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
64 100  amp Dopamine Hcl 40mg/ml 4,289.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
65 20 vials Dopamine 20mg/vial 418.00               NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
66 20 vials Dopamine Hcl 5% 250ml 10,400.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
67 500  capsules Doxycycline 100mg 495.00               NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
68 60  bottles D5 0.3% Nacl 1L 4,500.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
69 48  bottles D5 0.3% Nacl 500ml 2,853.12            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
70 60  bottles D5 0.9% Nacl 1L 3,900.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
71 30 bottles D5 IMB 500cc 1,783.20            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
72 30 bottles D5 NM 500ml 1,920.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
73 24  bottles D5 water 500ml 1,436.16            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
74 60  bottles D5LR 1L 3,480.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
75 60 bottles D5LR 500ml 3,386.40            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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76 1,000 bottles Nicardipine 10mg/ml amp 9,900.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
77 100 amp Epinephrine 1mg/ml 3,180.00            NO BID 2,900.00      NO BID NO BID 2,800.00        3,000.00        
78 2,000  tablets Febuxostat 40mg 50,000.00         35,000.00    30,000.00    NO BID NO BID 37,000.00      40,000.00      
79 2,000  capsules Fenofibrate 200mg 97,000.00         NO BID 60,000.00    NO BID NO BID 39,400.00      70,000.00      
80 2,000 tablets Ferrous sulfate+Folic acid 190mcg/400mcg 2,780.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
81 2,000 tablets Ferrous sulfate 325mg tab. 2,780.00            2,720.00      NO BID 2,520.00      NO BID 1,600.00        2,000.00        
82 288 bottles Ferrous sulfate 150mg/5ml  5,400.00            NO BID NO BID 5,400.00      NO BID 5,256.00        NO BID
83 100 amp Furosemide 10mg/ml 1,500.00            NO BID 1,200.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
84 50 amp Furosemide 20mg/2ml ampule 1,800.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 425.00           1,250.00        
85 1,000 tablets Gabapentin 300mg 19,500.00         13,650.00    15,000.00    17,100.00    NO BID 15,280.00      NO BID
86 100  tubes Gentamycin Optalmic/otic drp 10,000.00         NO BID 9,800.00      10,000.00    NO BID 8,800.00        NO BID
87 100 vials Hydrocortisone 100mg 4,500.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 3,400.00        3,500.00        
88 200 vials Hydrocortisone 250mg/vial 23,200.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 17,600.00      19,000.00      
89 89 bot Ibuprofen 100mg/5ml 25,632.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
90 100 amp Hyoscine Butylbromide 20mg/ml 2,134.00            NO BID 2,071.00      NO BID NO BID 2,020.00        NO BID
91 20 bottles Irrigating solution 1000ml 2,000.00            NO BID 2,000.00      NO BID NO BID 1,660.00        NO BID
92 500  tablets Isosorbide Mononitrate   7,500.00            NO BID 7,500.00      7,500.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID
93 500 tablets Isosorbide Dinitrate 5mg tab 6,500.00            NO BID 6,000.00      2,400.00      NO BID 840.00           NO BID
94 144 bottles Isoprinosine 250mg suspension 34,416.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
95 500 tablets Isoprinosine 500mg tab 6,250.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
96 144 bottles Lactulose 60ml 3.35g/5ml syrup 19,440.00         NO BID 17,712.00    NO BID NO BID 14,544.00      NO BID
97 500  tablets Levocetirizine 5mg 3,250.00            NO BID 2,000.00      NO BID NO BID 1,950.00        NO BID
98 500 tablets Levofloxacin  500mg 4,875.00            NO BID 3,750.00      NO BID NO BID 3,600.00        4,500.00        
99 500  capsules Loperamide 2,000.00            1,900.00      NO BID 945.00         NO BID 1,850.00        1,000.00        

100 500 tablets Loratadine 10mg 600.00               NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
101 3,000 tablets Losartan 50mg 4,500.00            4,380.00      3,600.00      4,200.00      NO BID 4,140.00        3,600.00        
102 100  amp Magnesium sulfate 250mg/ml 4,349.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
103 288  bottles Mebendazole 100mg/5ml syrup 6,048.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5,817.60        NO BID
104 1,000 capsules Mefenamic acid 250mg 1,000.00            NO BID NO BID 980.00         NO BID 840.00           990.00           
105 288 bottles Mefenamic acid 50mg/5ml 6,624.00            NO BID 6,624.00      6,336.00      NO BID 6,292.80        6,048.00        
106 3,000  capsules Mefenamic acid 500mg 3,750.00            3,720.00      2,910.00      3,660.00      NO BID 2,640.00        3,450.00        
107 500  tablets Mebendazole 500mg 1,500.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
108 500  tablets Methyldopa 250mg 15,500.00         10,075.00    NO BID 15,000.00    NO BID 3,500.00        12,500.00      
109 1,000 tablets Metformin 500mg tab 2,000.00            1,940.00      NO BID 1,200.00      NO BID 900.00           1,500.00        
110 1,000  tablets Metoclopromide 10mg 2,500.00            2,430.00      950.00         2,300.00      NO BID 1,200.00        1,500.00        
111 1,000 tablets Metoprolol 50mg tab 3,000.00            2,850.00      800.00         2,850.00      NO BID 1,100.00        1,500.00        
112 432  bottles Metoclopromide 5mg/5ml syr 11,232.00         11,119.68    9,936.00      11,232.00    NO BID 9,158.40        NO BID
113 10 amp Metoclopromide 10mg/ampule 895.00               NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 150.00           150.00           
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114 288  bottles Metronidazole 125mg/5ml sus 5,472.00            NO BID NO BID 5,472.00      NO BID 5,212.80        NO BID
115 1,000  tablets Metronidazole 500mg 1,090.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 980.00           1,050.00        
116 1,000 tablets Montelukast 4mg 12,000.00         9,000.00      NO BID 11,000.00    NO BID 3,200.00        10,000.00      
117 10 amp Morphine sulfate 10mg/ampule 497.00               NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
118 288  bottles Multivitamins (drops) 5,760.00            NO BID 5,184.00      5,760.00      NO BID 5,313.60        5,184.00        
119 2,000 capsules Multivitamins cap 4,500.00            4,060.00      3,000.00      2,800.00      NO BID 1,560.00        4,000.00        
120 288  bottles Multivitamins syr 4,896.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 4,798.08        NO BID
121 500  tubes Mupirocin 20mg/g ointment 47,500.00         NO BID 46,000.00    NO BID NO BID 35,000.00      45,000.00      
122 10  amp Nicardipine 1mg/ml 1,350.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1,200.00        1,300.00        
123 800  capsules Nifedipine 5mg 1,480.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1,440.00        
124 3,000 capsules Omeprazole 40mg cap 15,000.00         NO BID 14,850.00    15,000.00    NO BID 12,600.00      11,550.00      
125 100  vials Omeprazole 40mg vials 6,600.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 3,600.00        5,000.00        
126 1,000  sachets ORS 4,890.00            4,740.00      3,350.00      3,750.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID
127 50  tubes Eye Ointment (Oxytetracline) 38,900.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
128 288  bottles Paracetamol 100mg/ml drops 3,211.20            NO BID NO BID 3,211.20      NO BID NO BID NO BID
129 2,500  tablets Paracetamol 500mg 7,500.00            6,000.00      NO BID 2,450.00      NO BID NO BID 5,000.00        
130 120 bottles Paracetamol syrp. 125mg 2,130.00            NO BID NO BID 2,121.60      NO BID 2,025.60        NO BID
131 120 bottles Paracetamol susp 250mg 2,400.00            NO BID 2,142.00      2,382.00      NO BID 2,256.00        2,340.00        
132 288 bottles Phenylpropanolamine 125mg/5ml syrp 60ml 5,760.00            NO BID NO BID 5,702.40      NO BID 4,896.00        NO BID
133 20 amp Paracetamol 300mg/ampule (IV preparation) 900.00               NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 360.00           400.00           
134 288 bottles Phenylpropanolamine 6.25mg/ml drp 3,611.52            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 3,608.64        NO BID
135 3,000 tablets Paracetamol+Phenylpropanolamine 500mg 6,000.00            NO BID NO BID 5,940.00      NO BID 5,580.00        NO BID
136 1,000 tablets Paracetamol+tramadol 4,000.00            NO BID NO BID 4,980.00      NO BID 3,200.00        NO BID
137 60 bottles Plain LR 1L/bottle 3,596.40            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
138 60 bottles Plain LR 500ml 3,566.40            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
139 100 bottles Plain PNSS 1L/bottle 5,994.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5,994.00        NO BID
140 60 bottles PNSS 500ml 3,566.40            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
141 10 vials Potassium Chloride 40mEq/vial 650.00               NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 580.00           NO BID
142 500 tablets Prednisone 5mg 1,000.00            NO BID NO BID 520.00         NO BID 390.00           750.00           
143 144 bottles Prednisone 10mg/5ml sus. 12,957.12         NO BID NO BID 12,240.00    NO BID 10,368.00      12,240.00      
144 50  amp Ranitidine 25mg/ml 900.00               NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 895.00           
145 1,000  tablets Rosuvastatin 10mg 28,000.00         NO BID NO BID 17,880.00    NO BID 11,000.00      12,000.00      
146 2,000 nebules Salbutamol+Ipra 200mcg/1mg per ml 40,000.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 28,400.00      36,000.00      
147 2,000 nebules Salbutamol nebule 39,500.00         25,680.00    15,000.00    24,560.00    NO BID 21,000.00      30,000.00      
148 100  tubes Silver sulfadiazine 10mg/g ( cream) 9,500.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 8,800.00        9,000.00        
149 500 tablets B-adrenergic agonist (i.e. Salbutamol 2mg/ml) 1,000.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
150 30 bottles Sterile water 100ml 2,580.00            NO BID 2,550.00      NO BID NO BID 1,800.00        NO BID
151 30 bottles Sterile water 1000ml 2,850.00            NO BID 2,850.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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152 30 bottles Sterile water 50ml 1,882.50            NO BID 1,860.00      NO BID NO BID 1,740.00        NO BID
153 50 vials Tetanus Toxoid 0.5ml/vial 1,684.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
154 50 amp Sodium Bicarbonate 50mEq/ampule 4,500.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
155 50 vials Thiamine (usually in parenteral Vitamin B complex preparation) 3,750.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
156 100 drops Tobramycin drops 12,000.00         NO BID NO BID 11,800.00    NO BID 11,600.00      NO BID
157 500 tablets Tramadol+paracetamol 325mg/37.5 2,000.00            NO BID NO BID 2,000.00      NO BID 1,600.00        NO BID
158 500 capsules Tramadol 50mg/capsule 2,000.00            NO BID NO BID 1,870.00      NO BID 1,250.00        1,250.00        
159 1,000  capsules Tranexamic Acid 500mg 4,500.00            NO BID NO BID 4,180.00      NO BID 4,300.00        NO BID
160 500  tablets Trimitazidine 35mg 3,250.00            3,025.00      2,000.00      NO BID NO BID 2,100.00        3,000.00        
161 10 amp Verapamil 5mg/2ml ampule 1,585.50            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

   MEDICAL SUPPLIES  
1 20 boxes Alcohol 70% Swab 1,000.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 30 gallons Isopropyl Alcohol 70% Sanitizing Solution 25,860.00         NO BID 18,510.00    NO BID 6,900.00      9,300.00        NO BID
3 5 pieces Aldasan 2,000 3,750.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 3 pieces Ambu Bag PVC (Adult) 3,600.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID 2,917.20      3,300.00        NO BID
5 3 pieces Ambu Bag PVC (Pedia/Child) 3,600.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID 2,917.20      3,300.00        NO BID
6 15 gallons Povidone Iodine Antiseptic solution 10% 9,255.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 40 units Bp Apparatus Heavy Duty (Pedia) 32,000.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 15 gallons Cidex 15,750.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 30 rolls Cotton roll (400grams) 6,300.00            NO BID 6,000.00      5,850.00      4,657.50      5,340.00        NO BID

10 20 gallons Antibacterial Hand Liquid Soap 4,000.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
11 200 boxes Disposable face mask 19,600.00         NO BID NO BID 19,000.00    13,950.00    13,600.00      NO BID
12 100 boxes Disposable Gloves non-sterile (large) 100/box 65,000.00         NO BID 31,800.00    55,000.00    34,200.00    26,000.00      60,000.00      
13 100 boxes Disposable Gloves non-sterile (medium) 100/box 65,000.00         NO BID 31,800.00    55,000.00    34,200.00    26,000.00      60,000.00      
14 5 boxes Disposable Syringe 10cc with needle g-21 2,800.00            NO BID 2,350.00      NO BID 2,111.20      1,740.00        2,750.00        
15 10 boxes Disposable Syringe 3cc with needle g-23 3,500.00            NO BID NO BID 2,950.00      NO BID 1,980.00        3,000.00        
16 5 boxes Disposable Syringe 5cc with needle g-23 1,750.00            NO BID NO BID 1,475.00      1,430.00      1,200.00        1,500.00        
17 50 pieces Digital Thermometer 3,000.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID 3,292.80      2,750.00        NO BID
18 10 boxes Disposable Syringe 1cc with needle g-25 3,500.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2,400.00        3,000.00        
19 50 pieces Elastic Bandage 4x4 2,150.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID 1,282.50      NO BID NO BID
20 30 pieces Elastic Bandage 6x6 1,500.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID 1,174.50      NO BID NO BID
21 10 pieces ET Tube 7mm 2,000.00            NO BID 900.00         1,890.00      823.50         750.00           NO BID
22 10 pieces ET Tube 7.5mm 2,000.00            NO BID 900.00         1,890.00      823.50         750.00           NO BID
23 10 pieces ET Tube 5mm 2,000.00            NO BID 900.00         1,890.00      823.50         750.00           NO BID
24 10 pieces ET Tube 3.5mm 2,000.00            NO BID NO BID 1,890.00      823.50         650.00           NO BID
25 10 pieces ET Tube 2.5mm 2,000.00            NO BID NO BID 1,890.00      931.50         650.00           NO BID
26 10 pieces Feeding tube G4 1,500.00            NO BID NO BID 1,240.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID
27 10 pieces Feeding tube G9 1,500.00            NO BID NO BID 1,240.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID
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28 5 units Glucometer  (Heavy-Duty) 6,000.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID 5,700.00      5,750.00        NO BID
29 5 boxes Glucometer  Strips 3,500.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID 3,360.00      2,250.00        NO BID
30 25 pieces Infusion set 2,500.00            NO BID 2,200.00      2,000.00      NO BID 2,375.00        2,250.00        
31 10 pieces Iris Scissors Medium 2,000.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1,800.00        NO BID
32 600 pieces IV Cannula/IV Catheter G18 50/box 7,800.00            NO BID NO BID 7,788.00      NO BID 5,940.00        7,200.00        
33 600 pieces IV Cannula/IV Catheter G20 50/box 7,800.00            NO BID NO BID 7,788.00      NO BID 5,940.00        7,200.00        
34 600 pieces IC Cannula/IV Catheter G22  50/box 7,800.00            NO BID NO BID 7,788.00      NO BID 5,940.00        7,200.00        
35 750 pieces IV Cannula/IV Catheter G24  50/box 10,500.00         NO BID 10,500.00    9,735.00      NO BID 7,425.00        9,750.00        
36 750 pieces IV Cannula/IV Catheter G26  50/box 10,500.00         NO BID NO BID 9,735.00      NO BID 9,000.00        9,750.00        
37 30 tubes Jelly Lubricant 100ml 5,370.00            NO BID NO BID 5,370.00      NO BID 5,100.00        NO BID
38 10 gallons Disinfectant Solution Spray (kills 99.9% virus/bacteria) 20,990.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 20,800.00      NO BID
39 30 pieces Medicine cup small 1,050.00            NO BID 750.00         600.00         120.00         180.00           NO BID
40 20 pieces Metz scissor 1,500.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
41 20 boxes Surgical Tape (2.5cm) 11,980.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 7,200.00        NO BID
42 20 boxes Surgical Tape (5cm) 11,980.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
43 20 boxes Surgical Tape 1'' 11,980.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 10,400.00    7,200.00        NO BID
44 20 boxes Surgical Tape 2'' 11,000.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 10,400.00    9,000.00        NO BID
45 10 pieces Mayo scissor (Large) 3,650.00            NO BID NO BID 2,750.00      NO BID 3,400.00        NO BID
46 50 pieces Neb. Kit with mask (Adult) 3,000.00            NO BID 3,000.00      NO BID 2,730.00      2,700.00        2,750.00        
47 50 pieces Neb. Kit with mask (Pedia) 3,000.00            NO BID 3,000.00      NO BID 2,730.00      2,700.00        2,750.00        
48 3 pieces Nebulizer  Machine 5,100.00            NO BID NO BID 5,094.00      3,468.00      3,300.00        
49 100 pieces O2 nasal cannula Adult 2,300.00            NO BID 2,300.00      2,200.00      1,755.00      1,880.00        
50 20 pieces O2 nasal cannula Newborn 440.00               NO BID NO BID NO BID 425.00         NO BID
51 50 pieces O2 nasal Cannula Adult with mask 1,150.00            NO BID NO BID 1,100.00      NO BID NO BID
52 50 pieces O2 nasal cannula Pedia with mask 1,150.00            NO BID NO BID 1,100.00      NO BID NO BID
53 1 unit Otoscope Opthalmoscope (2 in 1 Diagnostic LED Fiber)Tool 3,500.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
54 5 units Oxygen regulator 8,500.00            NO BID 7,000.00      8,250.00      5,644.80      6,000.00        
55 50 pieces Penlight heavy-duty 2,150.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
56 5 gallons Hydrogen Peroxide 3,000.00            NO BID NO BID 2,600.00      1,540.00      1,990.00        
57 20 pieces Pedia Stethoscope 12,000.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
58 15 sets Pulse Oximeter (heavy-duty) 15,750.00         NO BID 15,000.00    14,250.00    NO BID 9,750.00        
59 100 rolls Rolled Gauze 36x 100 97,000.00         NO BID 97,000.00    94,800.00    88,965.00    86,500.00      
60 10 pieces Rubber suction (medium) 250.00               NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
61 10 pieces Rubber suction small (blue) 200.00               NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
62 20 boxes Sterile Gloves Size'7 12,500.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
63 20 boxes Sterile Gloves Size'8 12,500.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
64 50 pieces Medical Plaster Strips Adhesive 7,500.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID 3,375.00      7,500.00        
65 5 boxes Surgical Blades no.11 850.00               NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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66 5 boxes Surgical Blades no.20 850.00               NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
67 5 boxes Suture Chromic 3/0 cutting 1,749.60            NO BID 1,700.00      1,675.00      NO BID 1,510.00        
68 5 boxes Suture Chromic 3/0 round 1,749.60            NO BID 1,700.00      1,675.00      NO BID 1,510.00        
69 5 boxes Suture Plain 3/0 cutting 1,750.00            NO BID NO BID 1,675.00      NO BID 1,700.00        
70 5 boxes Suture Plain 2/0 cutting 1,750.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
71 100 boxes Suture-Prolene  4/0 Cutting 49,975.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
72 100 boxes Suture-Prolene 3/0 Cutting 45,000.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
73 5 pieces Stylet FR 10 2,420.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID 562.50         2,415.00        
74 5 pieces Stylet FR 12 2,420.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID 562.50         2,415.00        
75 5 pieces Stylet FR 6 2,420.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID 562.50         2,415.00        
76 100 pieces Urine Collector Pedia 1,000.00            NO BID 600.00         645.00         525.00         400.00           
77 5 pieces Cervical Collar (large) 1,500.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
78 5 pieces Cervical Collar (medium) 1,500.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
79 5 pieces Cervical Collar (small) 1,500.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
80 1 unit Weighing Scale for Infant (Digital) 4,500.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 3,500.00        
81 1 unit 12 Lead ECG Machine w/ paper 14,000.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
82 5 units Gooseneck Lamp w/ Stand 7,500.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
83 10 pieces Duracell Lithium Battery 123 CR17345 3V 4,000.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
84 50 pieces Tourniquet 1,500.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID 460.35         750.00           
85 5 pieces Tweezers canister stainless (Big) 1,750.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1,750.00        
86 200 pieces Vacutainer Tube (Purple) 4,000.00            NO BID NO BID 2,900.00      NO BID 990.00           
87 200 pieces Vacutainer Tube (Red) 4,000.00            NO BID NO BID 2,900.00      NO BID 990.00           
88 40 gallons Sodium Hydrochloride Disinfectant solution 18,000.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 8,800.00        

Grand Total 2,192,572.14    251,536.28 634,129.80 874,988.20 256,544.05 1,011,652.88 725,153.00    


